MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS
Ascension Parish Purchasing Department

August 17,2023 @ 10:00am
Bid Tabulation On Line Bids __5
BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
Clarke Mosquito | Veseris MSDS | Target Specialty Adapco, Inc. Heritage Landscape Group | Gaubert Oil Co.
CHEMICALS Control - MSDS MSDS MSDS LLC. MSDS MSDS
30+30 $76.86 $187.49 $192.50 $237.40 $182.60 NO BID
2.5 GALLON CONTAINER ’ ) ) ) )
DUET $169.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2.5 GALLON CONTAINER ’
MASTERLINE
BIFENTHRIN 7.9 NO BID $22.49 $32.84 NO BID $26.40 NO BID
1 QUART CONTAINER
BVA-2,2. ALLON
C O’NTS A(I;NER o Awarded to this
vendor *per Shawn's NO BID $41.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID
justification $43.26
BVA-2, 55 GALLON DRUM
$2016.85, $36.37 per NO BID $891.50 $1,203.95 NO BID NO BID
gallon
BTI GRANULES CG 40 Ib.
BAGS
NO BID $83.25 $70.80 $80.00 $107.82 NO BID
VECTOLEX WDG 1 LB
CONTAINERS PER CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID $62.40 NO BID NO BID
ALTOSID BRIQUETS PER $520.00 $520.00 $520.00 NO BID $160.86- Bld('ier non- NO BID
CASE responsive
CLEAR MINERAL OIL $3,008.50, per 275 $3,489.60, per 275
GALLON SIZE TOTE $24.26, per gallon gallon tote gallon tote $5,203.00, per 275 gallon tote NO BID $9.45, per gallon




DELTA METHRIN 2.5

GALLON CONTAINER NO BID NO BID $638.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
DELTA METHRIN $61,750, per 250
GALLON SIZE TOTE NO BID NO BID R NO BID NO BID NO BID
FYFANON ULV 2.5
GALLON CONTAINER NO BID $202.50 NO BID $230.30 NO BID NO BID
FYFANON ULV GALLON $22,092.20 per 260 gallon
SIZE TOTE NO BID NO BID NO BID tote NO BID NO BID
MOSQUITO MIST 2.5
GALLON CONTAINER $84.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MOSQUITO MIST
GALLON SIZE TOTE $84.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VPR VECTOPRIME FG 40 | $622.40, $15.56 per NO BID NO BID $174.80 NO BID NO BID
Ib. BAGS Ib.
Purchasing Department Cynthia LePBlanc Date 8/17/2023
Purchasing Department Devin Russ Date 8/17/2023
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