Parish of Ascension Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation Sheet

BID NAME

. Bid 3M Traffic Control Signs, Materials & Supplies

Number of Bids Received: 1

Bid Opening: May 16, 2023 @ 10:00 AM CST

Budgeted Operative Supplies

Parish of Ascension Government

615 East Worthey St., Gonzales, Louisiana 70737

Phone: 450-1115  Fax: 450-1120

www.ascensionparish.net

Buyers Name: Nolie Delatte

Detour - 30” x 24” M4-9 EA 35.70
Type 3 Object Marker Left - 12” x 36” OM-3L EA 21.00
Type 3 Object Marker Right - 12” x 36" OM-3R EA 21.00

Red Diamond (End of Roadway) - 18” x 18” OM4-3 EA 16.80

Do Not Block Intersection - 12" x 8" R10-7 EA 9.00

Do Not Block Intersection - 18" x 24" R10-7 EA 21.00

Do Not Block Intersection - 24" x 30" R10-7 EA 35.70

Do Not Block Intersection - 30" x 36" R10-7 EA 37.50
Stop Signs Red - 30” x 30” R1-1 EA 43.50
Stop Signs Red - 48" x 48” R1-1 EA 112.00
Roundabout R6-5P EA (30x30”) 43.50
No Parking on Pavement R8-1 EA (24x30”) 35.70




No Parking Except on Shoulder R8-2 EA (24x30”) 35.70
No Parking Symbol R8-3 EA (24x24”) 28.00
No Parking R8-3a EA (12x18”) 12.00
Except Sundays and Holidays R8-3bP EA (30x24”) 35.70
On Pavement R8-3cP EA (30x24”) 35.70
On Bridge R8-3dP EA (30x24”) 35.70
On Tracks R8-3eP EA (30x24”) 35.70
Except on Shoulder R8-3fP EA (30x24”) 35.70
Loading Zone R8-3gP EA (30x24”) 35.70
6:00 AM to 6:00 PM R8-3hP EA (30x24”) 35.70
Emergency Parking Only R8-4 EA (30x24”) 35.70
No Stopping on Pavement R8-5 EA (30x24”) 35.70
No Stopping Except on Shoulder R8-6 EA (30x24”) 35.70
Emergency Stopping Only R8-7 EA (30x24”) 35.70
Road Closed - 48” x 30” R11-2 EA 70.00

Bridge Out - 48” x 30” R11-3b EA 70.00

Road Closed To Thru Traffic - 60” x 30” R11-4 EA 91.00




4” Permanent High-Performance Striping Tape

EA

? need more info,

(White/Yellow) No Bid
2 Way Reflective Pavement Markers (Yellow/Yellow) EA 2.90
2 Way Reflective Pavement Markers (White/Red) EA 2.90
Pavement Marker Adhesive — Bituminous & Epoxy EA 1.40
\l;l;ln(;\ljv(;ﬂectorized Pavement Markers (White and EA No bid
Yield - 30" x 30" R1-2 EA 39.75
Weight Limit - 18" x 24" R12-5 EA 21.00
Weight Limit - 24" x 36" R12-5 EA 42.00
4-Way Red & White - 6” x 12” R1-3-4 EA 5.00
3-Way Red & White - 6” x 12" R1-3a EA 5.00
All-Way Red & White - 18” x 6” R1-4 EA 6.50
Yield To Pedestrians "left arrow" - 18" x 24" R1-5L EA 21.00
Yield To Pedestrians "right arrow" - 18" x 24" R1-5R EA 21.00
Speed Limit 10 Sign Black & White - 18" x 24” R2-110 mph EA 21.00
Speed Limit 15 Sign Black & White - 18" x 24” R2-1 15 mph EA 21.00
Speed Limit 20 Sign Black & White - 18” x 24” R2-1 20 mph EA 21.00
Speed Limit 25 Sign Black & White - 18” x 24” R2-1 25 mph EA 21.00




Speed Limit 30 Sign Black & White - 18” x 24” R2-1 30 mph EA 21.00
Speed Limit 35 Sign Black & White - 18” x 24” R2-1 35 mph EA 21.00
Speed Limit 40 Sign Black & White - 18" x 24” R2-1 40 mph EA 21.00
Speed Limit 45 Sign Black & White - 18” x 24” R2-1 45 mph EA 21.00
Speed Limit 50 Sign Black & White - 18” x 24” R2-1 50 mph EA 21.00
Speed Limit 55 Sign Black & White - 18” x 24” R2-1 55 mph EA 21.00
Keep Right 18”x24” R4-7 EA 21.00
No U Turn (symbol) - 24" x 24" R3-4 EA 28.00
No U Turn (sign) - 24" x 24" R3-4a EA 28.00
One Way Left - 36" x 12" R6-1L EA 21.00
One Way Left - 54" x 18" R6-1L EA 47.50
One Way Right - 36" x 12" R6-1R EA 21.00
One Way Right - 54" x 18" R6-1R EA 47.50
One Way Left - 24" x 30" R6-2L EA 35.70
One Way Left - 30" x 36" R6-2L EA 52.00
One Way Right - 24" x 30" R6-2R EA 35.70
One Way Right - 30" x 36" R6-2R EA 43.50




Handicap Reserved Parking with Symbol — 12" x 18" R7-8 EA 12.00
No Parking Sign - 12” x 18” R8-3a EA 12.00
Railroad Advance Warning - 36” diameter W10-1 EA 70.00
Turn Left (symbol) - 30" x 30" W1-1L EA 35.70
Turn Right (symbol) - 30" x 30" W1-1R EA 35.70
Curve Left Black & Yellow —30” x 30" W1-2L EA 35.70
Curve Right Black & Yellow —30” x 30" W1-2R EA 35.70
Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 10 MPH — 18" x 18" W13-1P10 EA 17.00
Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 15 MPH — 18" x 18” W13-1P15 EA 17.00
Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 20 MPH — 18" x 18" W13-1P20 EA 17.00
Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 25 MPH — 18" x 18” W13-1P25 EA 17.00
Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 30 MPH — 18" x 18” W13-1P30 EA 17.00
Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 35 MPH — 18" x 18” W13-1P35 EA 17.00
Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 5 MPH — 18" x 18” W13-1P5 EA 17.00
Road Narrows 30”x30” W5-1 EA 43.50
Cross Traffic Does Not Stop W4-4pP EA 41.00
Reverse Turn Sign Left, Black & Yellow — 30" x 30” W1-3L EA 43.50




Reverse Turn Sign Right, Black & Yellow — 30" x 30” W1-3R EA 43.50
Dead End Black & Yellow 24” x 24” W14-1 EA 28.00
Dead End Black & Yellow 30” x 30” W14-1 EA 43.50
No Outlet Black & Yellow —30” x 30” W14-2 EA 43.50
Reverse Curve Sign Left, Black & Yellow — 30" x 30” W1-4L EA 43.50
Reverse Curve Sign Right, Black & Yellow —30” x 30” W1-4R EA 43.50
“S” Curve Left, Black, & Yellow - 30” x 30” W1-5L EA 43.50
“S” Curve Right, Black, & Yellow —30” x 30” W1-5R EA 43,50
Large Arrow — 48" x 24" W1-6 EA 56.00
Deaf Child Area - 18” x 24” W16-D EA 21.00
Large Double Arrow — 48" x 24” wW1-7 EA 56.00
Chevron Left - 18" x 24" W1-8L EA 21.00
Chevron Right - 18" x 24" W1-8R EA 21.00
Intersection Ahead W2-1 EA (30x30”) 43.50
Intersection Warning W2-2 EA (30x30”) 43.50
Intersection Warning W2-4 EA (30x30”) 43.50
Flagger (symbol) - 36” x 36” W20-7 EA 68.00




Men Working (symbol) - 36” x 36” W21-1a EA 68.00
Fresh Qil - 36” X 36” W21-2 EA 68.00
Mowing Ahead - 36” X 36” W21-8 EA 68.00
Stop Ahead with Symbol —30” x 30” W3-1 EA 70.00
Stop Ahead Message — 24" x 24” W3-1a EA 28.00
Stop Ahead Message — 30" x 30” W3-1a EA 43.50
Dangerous Intersection - 30" x 30" w411 EA 43.50
Narrow Bridge - 30" x 30" W5-2 EA 43.50
Bump - 30" x 30" Ws8-1 EA 43.50
Slippery Pavement W8-5 EA (36x36") 63.00
Uneven Lanes - 36” x 36” W8-11 EA 63.00
il:uw Children at Play w/symbol Black & Yellow - 18" x WO-12 EA 21.00
2” x 2”x 12’ Square Tube Posts EA 64.00
2” x 2”x 10’ Square Tube Posts EA 53.20
2% “x2%"“x3' Square Tube Post EA 25.90
R T 2
Square Tube Assembly Hardware EA 2.00




Complete Assembly for Attaching Street Sign to Signal

EA ? need more info, No Bid
Pole
8’ U-Channel Green Post Galvanized EA 32.50
10’ U-Channel Green Post Galvanized EA 42.00
5/16”X1”X1 %” Bolts, Nuts, Washer to install signs (per

EA .50
set)
5/16”X1”X2 %” Bolts, Nuts, Washer to install signs (per

EA .60
set)
6'-1/2" Green Post (for object markers) EA 20.00
7’ Green Post (for object markers) EA 22.50
2” A-frame Barricade EA 150.00
Bracket 91UFOL EA 8.95
Cross Bracket with 5-1/2" Slot EA 8.95
Cross Bracket with 12" Slot EA 16.80
Cross Bracket with 24" Slot EA 40.00
Adjustable Cross Bracket with 5-1/2" Slot EA 10.00
360-degree Adjustable Cross Bracket with 12" Slot EA 30.00
4X4 Bracket Cap with 3-1/2" Slot EA 25.00
4X4 Bracket Cap with 12" Slot EA 25.00
Traffic Barrels with Tire Ring & with Diamond Grade EA 68.00

Sheeting




Type | Barricade 24"; High Intensity Reflective
sheeting; 12-gauge steel legs- MUST MEET MUTCH
STANDARDS; INCLUDE ALL HARDWARD FOR
ASSEMBLY (IF NECESSARY); 1 RAIL

EA

45.00

Type |l Barricade 24"; High Intensity Reflective
sheeting; 12- gauge steel legs- MUST MEET MUTCD
STANDARDS; INCLUDE ALL HARDWARD FOR
ASSEMBLY (IF NECESSARY); 2 RAILS

EA

56.00

Type Il Barricade 48"; High Intensity Reflective
sheeting- MUST MEET MUTCD STANDARDS; INCLUDE
TELESPAR FEET AND ALL HARDWARD FOR ASSEMBLY;
3 RAILS

EA

220.00

Traffic Cone 28" - MUST MEET MUTCD STANDARDS,
MUST INCLUDE A 6" AND A 4" RETROREFLECTIVE
BAND; RATED FOR NIGHT AND/OR FREEWAY, HIGH-
SPEED ROADWAY GREATER THAN 45MPH.

EA

22.50

Traffic Cone 36" - MUST MEET MUTCD STANDARDS,
MUST INCLUDE A 6" AND A 4" RETROREFLECTIVE
BAND; RATED FOR NIGHT AND/OR FREEWAY, HIGH-
SPEED ROADWAY GREATER THAN 45MPH.

EA

28.50

Type AC Light; D-Cell 3-Volt; 2-Sided Visibility - MUST
MEET MUTCD STANDARDS

EA

23.00

Type B Light; D-Cell 3-Volt; 2-Sided Visibility - MUST
MEET MUTCD STANDARDS

EA

50.00

Type B Solar Powered — High Intensity Light (Red and
Yellow)

EA

130.00

High-Tack Application Paper Tape — WHITE —
12”x100yds

EA

? need more info, No Bid

Purchasing Department: /(v \

Purchasing Department:

o 51|23

Date: 5//(0 / 2023




