

BID NAME
 LIMESTONE #57 (Gray) #89 (Gray) #610 (Gray & Mexican)
 Number of Bids Received: 1
 Bid Opening: June 27, 2023 @10:00 am
Budgeted Material Supply



Parish Of Ascension Government
 615 East Worthy St. Gonzales, Louisiana 70737
 Phone : 450-1115 Fax: 450-1120
www.ascensionparish.net

	Bid / Per Ton		
#57 (Gray) Limestone	East	West	Picked-Up
Bear Industries	\$52.00	\$52.00	\$42.00
Rene's Industries	\$51.50	\$51.50	\$43.00
#89 (Gray) Limestone	East	West	Picked-Up
Bear Industries	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$70.00
Rene's Industries	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#610 (Gray) Limestone	East	West	Picked-Up
Bear Industries	\$51.00	\$51.00	\$41.00
Rene's Industries	\$49.50	\$49.50	\$41.00
#610 (Mexican) Limestone	East	West	Picked-Up
Bear Industries	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Rene's Industries	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Purchasing Department: _____
 Date: June 27, 2023

[Signature]

Purchasing Department: _____
 Date: June 27, 2023