BID NAME

Precast Reinforced Box Culverts

Number of Bids Received: 1

Bid Opening: June 6, 2023 @10:00 am

Budget: Budgeted Operative Supplies

Parish Of Ascension Government

615 East Worthey St. Gonzales, Louisiana 70737

Phone : 450-1115

Fax: 450-1120

www.ascensionparish.net

PRECAST REINFORCED BOX CULVERTS

PARISH PICK UP BOX CULVERTS PRICE
PER LINEAR FEET

DELIVERED BOX CULVERTS PRICE
PER LINEAR FEET

Weight per ft.

SIZE IN FEET SPAN-RISE SIZE in MM Span- Rise Feet Per Joint in Ibs Capitol Concrete Product LLC Capitol Concrete Product LLC
3X2 900 X 600 8 830 No Bid No Bid
3X3 900 X 900 8 930 No Bid No Bid
4X2 1200 X 600 8 1200 No Bid No Bid
4X3 1200 X 900 8 1300 $264.57 No Bid
4X4 1200 X 1200 8 1400 $290.56 No Bid
5X3 1500 X 900 8 1750 $348.57 No Bid
5X4 1500 X 1200 8 1900 $374.89 No Bid
5X5 1500 X 1500 6 2050 $400.81 No Bid
6X3 1800 X 900 6 1970 $443.00 No Bid
6X4 1800 X 1200 6 2150 $464.71 No Bid
6X5 1800 X 1500 6 2320 $518.83 No Bid
6X6 1800 X 1800 6 2500 $540.47 No Bid
7X4 2100 X 2100 6 2600 $562.09 No Bid
7X5 2100 X 1500 6 2800 $592.97 No Bid
7X6 2100 X 1800 6 3000 $626.96 No Bid
7X7 2100 X 2100 6 3200 $659.35 No Bid
8X3 2400 X 900 6 2600 No Bid No Bid
8X4 2400 X 1200 6 2800 $594.51 No Bid
8X5 2400 X 1500 6 3000 $626.96 No Bid
8X6 2400 X 1800 6 3200 $659.34 No Bid
8X7 2400 X 2100 6 3400 $691.80 No Bid
8X8 2400 X 2400 6 3600 $745.83 No Bid
9X5 2700 X 1500 6 3660 $756.66 No Bid
9X6 2700 X 1800 6 3880 $817.17 No Bid
9X7 2700 X 2100 5 4110 $863.87 No Bid
9X8 2700 X 2400 5 4330 $895.46 No Bid
9X9 2700 X 2700 5 4560 $927.46 No Bid
10X5 3000 X 1500 5 4380 $903.66 No Bid




10X6 3000 X 1800 5 4630 $947.86 No Bid
10X 7 3000 X 2100 4.5 3880 $989.67 No Bid
10X 8 3000 X 2400 4.5 5130 $1,058.26 No Bid
10X9 3000 X 2700 4 5380 $1,093.91 No Bid
10X 10 3000 X 3000 4 5630 $1,129.57 No Bid

Purchasing Department :

Purchasing Department:

Date: June 6, 2023

Date: June 6, 203




