BID NAME

Polyvinyl Chloride (PVC) Sewer/
Drainage Pipe

Number of Bids Received: 4

Bid Opening: October 11,2023 @10:00 am

Budget:Budgeted Supply Item

Parish Of Ascension Government

615 East Worthey St. Gonzales, Louisiana 70737

Phone : 450-1115

Fax: 450-1120

www.ascensionparish.net

VENDOR 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 30" 36" 42" 48"
Core and Main $10.35 $16.41 $23.29 $36.78 $39.11 $56.05 $74.94 No Bid No Bid
Coastal Culvert $9.45 $15.03 $21.22 $38.00 $38.17 $54.88 $75.00 No Bid No Bid
Coburns Supply $8.08 $12.82 $18.19 $30.64 $32.59 | $46.70 | $64.01 | NoBid | No Bid
Baton Rouge Winwater Works $9.70 $15.40 $21.80 $34.00 $38.70 $52.00 $72.80 No Bid No Bid

Purchasing Department

Purchasing Department

Date:October 11, 2023

Date: October 11, 2023




