BID NAME

Reinforced Concrete Pipe

Number of Bids Received: 2

Bid Opening: December 28,2023@9:00 am

Budget: Budgeted Supply Item

Parish Of Ascension Government

615 East Worthey St. Gonzales, Louisiana 70737

Phone : 450-1115 Fax: 450-1120

www.ascensionparish.net

Bid/ Per Foot
VENDOR: Triumph Construction, LLC Capitol Concrete Products, LLC
Size: Price per linear ft. Price per linear ft. Price per linear ft. Price per linear ft.
15" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $25.00 $23.84
18" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $7.50 $28.51
24" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $49.00 $45.29
30" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $70.00 $64.40
36" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $92.00 $88.89
42" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $118.00 $114.07
48" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $157.00 $145.07
54" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $22.00 $187.65
60" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $280.00 $216.07
15" Reinforced Concrete Pipe Arched $37.00 No Bid
18" Reinforced Concrete Pipe Arched $44.00 $35.95
24" Reinforced Concrete Pipe Arched $68.00 $54.74
30" Reinforced Concrete Pipe Arched $84.00 $76.18
36" Reinforced Concrete Pipe Arched $114.00 $99.63
42" Reinforced Concrete Pipe Arched $154.00 $124.72
48" Reinforced Concrete Pipe Arched No Bid No Bid
54" Reinforced Concrete Pipe Arched $264.00 No Bid
60" Reinforced Concrete Pipe Arched _ $326.00 No Bid
Purchasing Department : \NVI}\ 2 N___ Date: December 28, 2023

Purchasing Department:

Date: December 28, 2023




